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100 IDEAS THAT 
CHANGED DESIGN

$35.00

This inspiring book chronicles the 
most influential ideas that have 
shaped industrial and product 
design. Written by two experts on 
modern design, it provides both a 
concise history of the subject, and 
offers a fascinating resource to dip 
into for the general reader.  

CREATIVE SKETCHING
IN PRODUCT DESIGN

$100.00

Though computer rendering has 
been a huge boon to designers, 
drawing by hand is still 
indispensable when it comes to 
developing ideas and presenting 
concept art.  

DESIGN FOR CHILDREN
A comprehensive, genre-defining 
survey of children's product and 
furniture design from Bauhaus to 
today Design for Children, a 
must-have book for all 
style-conscious and design-savvy 
readers, documents the evolution of 
design for babies, toddlers, and 
beyond.

50 BAUHAUS ICONS 
YOU SHOULD KNOW

 This book selects the artists, 
buildings, furniture pieces, 
theatrical productions, toys, and 
textiles that epitomize the Bauhaus 
ideal of uniting form and function. 
Artists such as Josef Albers, László 
Moholy-Nagy, Wassily Kandinsky, 
and Joost Schmidt are featured 
along with lesser-known but equally 
important designers and artists. 

AUGUST 2022

$59.99

Many students are unsure what is 
expected within their sketchbook or 
art journal, or how to present their 
visual investigations in a compelling 
and creative way. Outstanding High 
School Sketchbooks contains 
sketchbook pages by high school 
art students from around the world. 
This includes students studying 
NCEA, IGCSE/GCSE, A level, and 
IB.

FASHION DESIGNERS A-Z

$58.00

From Azzedine Alaia, Cristobal 
Balenciaga, and Coco Chanel to 
Alexander McQueen, and Yves 
Saint Laurent, more than a 
century's worth of fashion greats 
from the permanent collection of 
The Museum at FIT in New York 
City are celebrated in this fresh 
edition of Fashion Designers A-Z.

VITAMIN T: THREADS & 
TEXTILES IN CONTEMPORARY 
ART PAPERBACK

$70.00

A global survey of more than 100 
artists, chosen by art-world 
professionals for their work with 
threads, stitching, and textiles.
Vitamin T is the latest in the 
celebrated series in which leading 
curators, critics, and art professionals 
nominate living artists for inclusion.

FABRIC FOR FASHION:
COMPLETE GUIDE

$65.00

Aimed at fashion designers, Fabric 
for Fashion: The Complete Guide is 
unique in explaining the behavior, 
properties and sustainability impacts 
of a wide range of natural and 
man-made fabrics. Design is 
determined by how fabrics work, 
move, feel and look. Increasingly and 
out of necessity, design is also led by 
how fabric choices affect our planet 
and its inhabitants. 

FASHION DESIGN RESEARCH
2ND EDITION

$49.99

Every fashion collection begins with 
research. But how do you start? 
How do you use that research? 
Fashion Design Research answers 
these questions and demystifies the 
process. The book begins with the 
basics of primary and secondary 
research sources and shows 
students how and where to gather 
information.

CIRCULAR FASHION
SUSTAINABLE FASHION

$55.00

Creating sustainable fashion has 
never been more important. Circular 
Fashion provides an accessible, 
practical, and holistic approach to 
this key topic for anyone studying 
fashion.This introductory text to 
sustainability in fashion includes 
best practice case studies and 
profiles of key companies such as 
Patagonia, Veja, Christopher 
Raeburn, and Stella McCartney. 

JOURNEYS IN 
NATURAL DYEING

$49.99

An international exploration of 
natural dyeing aimed at teaching 
beautiful, traditional techniques.
Similar to food and the act of 
sharing meals, our relationship to 
textiles-both creating them and 
using them-is a core tenet of our 
humanness. As with cooking, 
making textiles enables learning, 
shared experiences, conversations, 
and relationships. 

OUTSTANDING HIGH 
SCHOOL SKETCHBOOKS

SCHOOL PRICES NOW
AVAILABLE ON GORDON HARRIS

SCHOOLS DIRECT WEBSTORE!

THE MEN'S FASHION BOOK

$150.00

The first-ever authoritative A-Z 
celebration of the 500 greatest 
names in men's fashion - 200 years 
of men's style through the work of 
designers, brands, photographers, 
icons, models, retailers, tailors, and 
stylists around the globe. The Men's 
Fashion Book is an A-Z deep-dive 
into the people and brands that have 
produced and inspired memorable 
looks in menswear - and are 
advancing today's renaissance in 
men's clothing and style.

For access please contact one of our 
Account Managers

Auckland, Northland & South Island: Glenn Toms (glenn@gordonharris.co.nz)
Wellington & Lower North Island: Andrew Glennie (andrew@gordonharris.co.nz)

Waikato, Bay of Plenty, Gisborne: Kate Symmans (kate@gordonharris.co.nz)
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DESTINATION 
ARCHITECTURE

$50.00

Featuring 1,000 of today's most 
compelling buildings by the world's 
finest architects, Destination: 
Architecture is an unparalleled and 
comprehensive resource for 
anyone wanting to get more out of 
their travels. 

OPERATIVE DESIGN: 
SPATIAL
The core idea for this project is to 
use operative verbs as tools for 
designing space. These operative 
verbs abstract the idea of spatial 
formation to its most basic terms, 
allowing for an objective approach 
to create the foundation for 
subjective spatial design. 

MODULES HOW MANY 
DO YOU NEED

$49.99

How many modules do you need to 
live? 
With this simple question we 
present this new book about 
prefabricated and modular 
construction. Showing options for 
expanding or downsizing according 
to each person’s need for space, 
and the ease with which you can 
move the home to a new place. 
Homes that are economical, green, 
and durable.

YOUNG VISIONARIES NEW 
GENERATION OF ARCHITECTS

This book presents architects 
ranging in age from their 
mid-twenties to their mid-forties 
who with a few already 
implemented buildings have caught 
the attention of the sector experts 
and opened the eyes of the general 
public to what is coming. 

VIVIENNE WESTWOOD 
CATWALK

$120.00

One of the most thought-provoking 
and influential designers in the world 
- she once declared 'the only reason 
I'm in fashion is to destroy the word 
"conformity"' - Vivienne Westwood 
has been reinventing, changing and 
challenging the world of fashion for 
over five decades.

CHANEL CATWALK

$110.00

The best-selling Chanel Catwalk 
was the first book to gather every 
Chanel collection ever created by 
Karl Lagerfeld in a single volume – 
a unique opportunity to chart the 
development of one of the world’s 
most influential fashion brands and 
discover rarely seen collections.

PRADA CATWALK

$110.00

This definitive publication opens with 
a concise history of the house, 
followed by a brief biographical 
profile of Miuccia Prada, before 
exploring the collections themselves, 
organized chronologically.

YSL CATWALK

$110.00

Founded by Yves Saint Laurent and 
Pierre Berge in 1961, shortly after 
the young couturier left his post at 
the helm of Christian Dior, Yves 
Saint Laurent would soon become 
one of the most successful and 
influential haute couture houses in 
Paris. 

LOUIS VUITTON CATWALK

$110.00

Founded as a luxury leather goods 
house in 1854, Louis Vuitton was 
for many decades one of the 
world's leading trunk and 
accessories makers. It was after 
launching its first fashion collections 
in 1998, however, that the house 
reached unprecedented global 
fame, and pioneered high-profile 
collaborations with artists such as 
Richard Prince, Takashi Murakami 
and Stephen Sprouse.

VERSACE CATWALK

$120.00

"In this book, you find the soul of 
Versace. I could not be any more 
proud to share it with the world." 
Donatella Versace. Founded by 
Gianni Versace in 1978, the 
family-run fashion house soon grew 
into a symbol of high glamour and 
luxury known the world over, 
dressing the biggest personalities 
of the 1980s and 1990, then 
steering it into the 21st century and 
cementing its status for new fans.

PAUL SMITH

$120.00

A new monograph capturing the 
unique spirit and one-of-a-kind 
creativity of British fashion icon Sir 
Paul Smith. Created in close 
collaboration with design legend Sir 
Paul Smith, Paul Smith celebrates 
the iconic brand through the lens of 
50 objects, chosen by Sir Paul 
himself for the inspiration they have 
provided him over the years.

MARIMEKKO: THE ART OF
PRINTMAKING

$110.00

Finnish for 'Mary's dress', 
Marimekko was founded in 1951 by 
Armi Ratia. Going against the 
restrictive fashion of the period, it 
produced flowing dresses in abstract 
patterns and vibrant colours, which 
remain the house's signature to this 
day. Blending photographs and 
advertisements with modern 
campaign imagery as well as newly 
commissioned photography, this 
book tells the story of the house's 
most iconic designs.

DIOR CATWALK

$110.00

This book gathers together, for the 
first time, every Dior haute couture 
collection, including also 
ready-to-wear collections after the 
arrival of John Galliano (when 
ready-to-wear presentations took 
on a new importance), and the first 
two collections designed by 
creative director Maria Grazia 
Chiuri, appointed in 2016. 

VOGUE:FANTASY & FASHION

$155.00

This third edition has been updated 
to include the latest design and 
construction techniques and 
stunning new visual examples. 
New and updated interviews with 
practitioners working for leading 
fashion brands offer key insights 
into succeeding in the industry 
today and a preface by fashion 
designer and instructor Shelley 
Fox introduces and contextualizes 
the new edition. 

CATWALK



3

TINY MOBILE HOMES

$49.99

More and more people prefer the 
simplicity of a small mobile home to 
enjoy nature instead of a 
conventional house. It’s about 
swapping luxury for freedom. These 
houses are built on a trailer so they 
can be transported and are more 
complete than a caravan, with a 
high quality design finish.

MODULAR MICRO 
APARTMENTS
It shouldn’t come as a surprise if 
you hear that it is the integration of 
storage solutions that really rounds 
off a good home design. With no 
doubt, it is a crucial design element 
that requires great attention to 
detail. 

3D THINKING IN DESIGN 
AND ARCHITECTURE

$60.00

The geometric forms and patterns in 
today's architecture and decorative 
arts have been deeply influenced by 
past cultures. From humankind's first 
path-like doodles on cave walls 
through to the higher abstractions 
developed to make measurements 
and predictions, the 3-dimensional 
forms we design and build are 
dependent upon available materials, 
human needs and the limitations of 
our imaginations.  

ORNAMENT IS CRIME 
MODERNIST ARCHITECTURE
Ornament Is Crime is a celebration 
and a thought-provoking 
reappraisal of modernist 
architecture. The book proposes 
that modernism need no longer be 
confined by traditional definitions, 
and can be seen in both the iconic 
works of the modernist canon by Le 
Corbusier, Mies van der Rohe, and 
Walter Gropius

FASHION DRAPING 
TECHNIQUES VOL 1

$69.99

Draping, also known as moulage, is 
a fashion design technique that 
involves working with fabric directly 
on a mannequin, 'sculpting' the toile 
on a dress form. Imagination and 
freedom are the key principles of this 
process, allowing the designer to 
start from an idea and change it as 
the garment progresses. 

ADVANCED CREATIVE
DRAPING

$90.00

Advanced Creative Draping teaches 
designers and students how to drape 
fashion-forward, conceptual designs 
that use elements of couture 
construction to elevate the work to the 
highest level of fashion. Five methods 
of draping are explored as well as 
draping using embellishments or 
particular surface designs. The final 
chapter demonstrates how to create a 
high-quality heirloom garment.

PATTERN CUTTING FOR
MENSWEAR

$100.00

 Packed with profiles of industry 
pioneers, Q&As with key figures 
and over 300 illustrations, this is the 
complete history of fashion's 
fastest-growing and most influential 
movement. Whether focusing on 
major brands such as Stussy, 
Carhartt, & SHUT or today's 
up-and-comers from South African 
townships or downtown Seoul, this 
dynamic study surveys the scene. 

PATTERNMAKING FOR 
WOMENSWEAR VOL 1 
(Due August)

$89.99

The first volume of six comprising 
all aspects of patternmaking for 
womenswear, this book is a 
comprehensive approach to the 
fundamentals of flat-pattern drafting 
for skirts in all their variations and 
forms. This book contains the 
perfect method for creating skirts, 
explained in a simple, clear, 
precise, highly detailed manner.

ROTARY CUTTING BASICS

$29.99

Rotary cutting confidence is 
possible with this beginner-friendly 
reference book! Learn how to 
choose the right cutter for the job, 
how to use a cutter safely, and 
beginner and advanced 
techniques you can accomplish 
with a rotary cutter. Take the 
guesswork out of purchasing tools 
and equipment and learn how to 
safely use your rotary cutter.

SEWING MANUAL: SKIRTS
AND TROUSERS

$89.99

Tired of wearing the same clothes? 
How about revamping your 
wardrobe with new custom made 
clothes? This is a practical sewing 
manual that shows all the steps for 
making skirts and trousers, from the 
basics, like different hand stitches 
and using a sewing machine, to 
taking measurements and 
understanding patterns.

EMPOWERED EMBROIDERY

$32.99

With Art Makers: Empowered 
Embroidery, learn to sketch and 
stitch strong, recognizable women 
from all walks of life. Featuring 
sketching and illustration 
instructions, basic stitches, 
embroidery techniques, and 6 
projects with portraits of famous 
women, this book is a must-have 
tool for hands-on artists and 
crafters.

BASIC BLACK: 26 EDGY
ESSENTIALS

$29.99

Sew chic, dark-toned clothes with 
this stylish sewing book and add a 
touch of originality to your 
wardrobe. Basic Black is the 
English edition of a classic 
Japanese sewing book which 
provides sew-it-yourself 
Western-sized patterns for 26 
basic garments.

FASHION DRAPING 
TECHNIQUES VOL 2

$69.99

Following the first volume of 
Fashion Draping Techniques, which 
focused on details, this new volume 
takes a step forward and moves on 
to complete items of clothing, such 
as dresses, blouses, jackets, and 
skirts, all explained in a detailed 
and easy to understand manner. 
Each chapter also includes 
suggestions about what kind of 
fabric to use in each piece of 
clothing.

GEOMETRY OF HAND
SEWING

$54.99

As makers, we tend to learn 
different stitches over time without 
thinking much about how they 
relate to one another. But when 
Natalie Chanin and her Alabama 
Chanin and The School of Making 
teams began to look at needlework 
closely, they realized all stitches are 
based on geometric grid 
systems-and by using grids as 
guides, they could make learning 
stitches, as easy as child's play.

FASHION TECHNIQUES
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DESIGN(H)ERS:WOMEN 
IN DESIGN

$65.00

DESIGN(H)ERS is a stunning 
showcase of 30 female talents 
spanning across a variety of design 
mediums to highlight the diversity 
that women bring to their respective 
fields. With insightful interviews 
revolving around the thoughts and 
stories of pioneers who have 
already made their mark, this book 
serves to inspire and encourage the 
creatives of the future.

100 IDEAS THAT CHANGED 
GRAPHIC DESIGN
This accessible book demonstrates 
how ideas influenced and defined 
graphic design. Lavishly illustrated, 
it is both a great source of 
inspiration and a provocative record 
of some of the best examples of 
graphic design from the last 
hundred years. 

THE BEST OF 
GRAPHIC DESIGN

$139.99

Loaded with winning designs 
carefully chosen by prominent 
industry judges, you'll enjoy going 
behind the scenes with top winners 
of PRINT Regional Design Awards; 
HOW International Design Awards; 
HOW Promotion & Marketing 
Design Awards; and HOW 
In-House Design Awards.

PITCHING IDEAS

We are good at designing beautiful 
products and we offer good 
services. We always know exactly 
what the user wants and we know 
dozens of methodologies. However, 
if we have to convince our 
customers and colleagues, we find 
it very hard. 

STITCH IN BLOOM

$32.99

Stitch in Bloom is a gorgeous new 
embroidery book, celebrating the 
art of couching, an embellishment 
technique used to adorn fabrics.
Artist and mixed-media textile 
designer, Lora Avedian 
demonstrates the versatility of this 
stitch using different materials to 
produce a range of finishes before 
showcasing 15 stunning projects to 
try yourself.

ENCHANTING EMBROIDERY 
DESIGN

$24.99

Enchanting Embroidery Designs 
invites you to create your own world 
using bright thread colors and 
imaginative stitches. Full of motifs 
that are both simple and playful, 
from zany crocodiles, and cuddly 
cats to big-eared bats and stealthy 
ravens. This book invites you to be 
creative with its whimsical designs 
and step-by-step instructions.

COMPLETE BAG MAKING 
MASTERCLASS

$45.00

Expert bag designer, Mrs H, has 
created a collection of the latest 
bag making techniques and 8 
full-size bag patterns, based on her 
popular weekend bag making 
retreats. This collection of bag 
making techniques will teach you 
how to sew better bags. Learn all 
the key techniques including: 
adding different types of pockets; 
inserting zips; and making handles. 

PUNCH NEEDLE 
EXTRAVAGANNZA

$49.99

This project book is less how-to and 
more "dive right in!" Here are 27 
inspired ways to add colorfully 
crafted inspiration to your decor, 
your wardrobe, everyday 
accessories, and your artistic 
gift-giving needs. For those who are 
newcomers to the punch needle 
world, and for all who have learned 
the skills and are ready for new, 
one-of-a-kind projects that really 
excite their creative style! 

BAGS FOR LIFE: 21
PROJECTS TO MAKE

$39.99

 Featuring a variety of different 
poses, these templates allow you to 
get down to business and sketch 
your designs right away, without 
worrying about drawing models. 
The sketchpad pages are specially 
designed so that they can be 
photocopied without the templates, 
leaving just the fashion sketch! 

SUPERCUTE SEWING

$49.99

Discover a colourful world of 
adorable animals and fantastical 
creatures in this fun collection of 
sewn toys and gifts, brought 
together into one volume for the first 
time.Children and adults will adore 
this collection of cute stuffed toys 
and home accessories by soft toy 
designer, Melly McNeice. There are 
a total of twenty projects to choose 
from so there is something for 
everyone.

EMBROIDERY FOR EVERYONE

$49.99

Our connection to the 
'everyday'and the 'domestic' 
provides a wealth of inspiration and 
continues to inform the creative 
processes of artist Cas Holmes. 
Resourcefulness and 'making do' 
using materials and subjects 
available to hand, results in lyrical 
works connected to time and place.

100 MICRO CROCHET 
MOTIFS

$49.99

Explore the world of micro crochet 
with this collection of crochet 
patterns and charts for 100 
exquisite crochet motifs. This 
collection of tiny crochet motifs from 
talented crochet designer, Steffi 
Glaves, explores the world of 
miniature in crochet form. The 
instructions show you how to create 
your own micro crochet makes to 
create a range of crochet pieces 
that can be used in many ways.

TEXTURES FROM NATURE 
IN TEXTILE ART

$45.00

Harness the beauty of the natural 
world to create unique textile art 
pieces. For textile artists and 
embroiderers, nature is a perennially 
favourite theme, and Marian Jazmik 
creates some of the best 
nature-inspired textile art around.
Learn how to begin with photography, 
homing in on details in nature and 
manipulating the resulting images to 
create microscopic and often 
surprising detail.

RESILIENT STITCH

$45.00

Following on from her textile hit 
Slow Stitch, author Claire 
Wellesley-Smith considers the 
importance of connection and ideas 
around wellbeing when using 
textiles for individuals and 
communities, including practical 
ideas around 
'thinking-through-making', using 
'resonant' materials and extending 
the life of pieces using traditional 
and non-traditional methods. 

TEXTILES
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RESPONSIVE LOGOS

$125.00

This book helps designers 
make logos that are both useful 
and stylish in this digital era, 
through examples of brands 
with design variants for all 
types of physical and digital 
supports in addition to the 
responsive adaptation of the 
brand in diverse display 
formats.

GRAPHIC STYLE 
4TH EDITION
This visual survey of graphic design 
styles through the ages is an 
essential resource for designers, art 
and design students, and art lovers. 
With more than 700 illustrations, it 
is the only wide-ranging history of 
graphic design to be completely 
visual, and many readers treasure it 
for its amazing trove of images. 

VINTAGE MODERN
DESIGN WITH A PAST

$89.99

Drawing inspiration from the past is 
fertile ground for designers, who 
often update classic iconography to 
create modern designs that evoke 
the charm of previous decades 
while staying true to a client's 
needs. These creatives blend the 
look and feel of vintage logos with 
retro clip art and period colors to 
respond to market trends and 
communicate a brands mission. 

BLACK & WHITE GRAPHICS

Black and White Graphics 
showcases the appealing impact of 
using monochrome color schemes 
in the field of graphic design, and it 
presents an international collection 
of work that makes clear the 
capabilities of black, white, and 
gray. 

SUSTAINABLE FASHION

$75.00

The planet has reached a critical 
point and it is up to us all to 
innovate and drive change in all 
aspects of life, including how we 
design, produce and purchase our 
clothing. The fashion industry and 
its procedures are changing rapidly 
thanks to the visionary mindset of 
innovators, the renewal of industrial 
processes, and a reconsideration of 
existing values.

THE MENDING DIRECTORY

$39.99

Clothing repair through visible 
mending is a movement that now 
has hundreds and thousands of 
followers, and Erin Eggenburg is 
one of the leading proponents.
Through her beautiful stitch 
designs, Erin shows you how to 
hand stitch or darn your clothes and 
other fabric items to mend them, 
rather than discard them.  

CIRCULAR DESIGN FOR
FASHION

$80.00

At heart, this book aims to inspire 
fearless innovators committed to 
spearheading the future of fashion. It 
is for all of us looking to make a 
positive impact in an industry that we 
love and care about. It is 
increasingly acknowledged that the 
practice of design is not exclusive to 
designers, nor is it found only in 
studios.

MODERN MENDING

$54.99

Bring new life to your old clothes 
and fabrics with this fun, 
easy-to-follow guide to modern 
mending. Across the globe, we 
send tonnes of clothing to landfills 
each year. In fact, clothing 
consumption in the UK and US is 
one of the highest in the world. But 
the good news is that mending is 
trending, and it's never been easier 
to repair and reinvent your favourite 
clothes.

ZERO WASTE GIFT 
WRAP FUROSHIKI

$29.99

Embrace zero waste living with this 
collection of sustainable gift wrap 
solutions including furoshiki, the 
traditional Japanese technique of 
fabric knotting. What could be nicer 
than receiving a present AND the 
beautiful scarf it's wrapped in! 

FASHION DESIGN COURSE 
3RD ED REVISED UPDATED
(Due September)

$39.99

Becoming a successful fashion 
designer involves understanding a 
wide variety of core principles. This 
foundation course is an ideal 
introduction for students, 
dressmakers and anyone 
interested in the creative side of 
fashion. 

THE ART OF REPAIR

$49.99

In The Art of Repair, Molly Martin 
explores the humble origins of 
repair and how the act of mending 
a cherished item carefully by hand 
offers not just a practical solution 
but nourishment for the soul. Using 
her own beautiful illustrations, she 
guides us through the basics of the 
craft - from piecing and patching to 
the ancient Japanese art of 
Sashiko.

SASHIKO FOR MAKING 
AND MENDING

$29.99

Let this book show you the 
pleasure of repairing, reinforcing 
and making beloved items using 
sashiko embroidery! Sashiko for 
Making and Mending shows you 
how to use sashiko stitching to 
mend rips, repair things like fraying 
cuffs and create original 
accessories that look fabulous.

NATURAL DYEING WORK 
WITH PLANT DYES

$39.99

This book goes back to basics with 
simple dots and lines, 
demonstrating how even basic 
squares, circles and triangles can 
have a stunning impact in stitch and 
textiles. She provides practical and 
simple instructions for developing 
and experimenting with pattern, 
using grids, symmetry, rotation and 
repeats.

CREATIVE MENDING

$45.00

Mend, rethink, transform, recreate!
Mending your favorite fabric 
items--from jeans to sweaters to 
sofa covers--becomes a true art 
form in Creative Mending. In this 
book, mending guru Hikaru 
Noguchi shows you her entire 
range of valuable techniques--from 
embroidery and patching to darning 
and felting--that are just challenging 
enough for experienced menders.
. 

SUSTAINABLE FASHION
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BRAND IDENTITY 
ESSENTIALS 

$45.00

Brand Identity Essentials, Revised 
and Expanded outlines and 
demonstrates basic logo and 
branding design guidelines and 
rules through 100 principles. These 
include the elements of a 
successful graphic identity, identity 
programs and brand identity, and all 
the various strategies and elements 
involved. 

THE LOGO DESIGN
IDEA BOOK
Arrows, swashes, swooshes, globes, 
sunbursts and parallel, vertical and 
horizontal lines, words, letters, 
shapes and pictures. Logos are the 
most ubiquitous and essential of all 
graphic design devices, representing 
ideas, beliefs and, of course, things. 
The 50 logos in this book are 
examples of good ideas in the 
service of representation, reputation 
and identification.

DESIGNING WITH TYPE

$59.99

New information and new images 
make this perennial best-seller an 
even more valuable tool for anyone 
interested in learning about 
typography. First published in 1971, 
this title is used universally ever 
since. It provides access to lessons 
from distinguished typographers 
around the world through Web site. 
More than 250,000 are sold.

DOING 2019/2020

In these roughly 400 pages, you 
can find award-winning products for 
your garden, leisure, sport and play, 
but also for children and babies. In 
addition, the book will introduce you 
to fashion and lifestyle products 
with design value. The Doing 
2018/2019 manual provides all 
those interested in design with a 
fascinating overview of current 
products and future innovations.

WATERCOLOUR FASHION 
ILLUSTRATION

$49.99

Learn to paint outstanding fashion 
watercolors with expert guidance 
from a leading fashion illustrator.
Watercolor is a wonderful medium 
for figure and fashion as it creates 
loose, impressionistic results that 
capture the essence of a look 
without getting too bogged down in 
the details. 

PAINT WITH THREAD

$69.99

Slow down and embroider your way 
through the changing seasons with 
the beautiful debut book from 
embroidery artist and rising star 
Emillie Ferris. Needlepainting, also 
known as thread painting or silk 
shading, is a form of embroidery 
that creates a realistic, lifelike effect 
using a single strand of thread and 
one simple stitch - the 'long and 
short' stitch.

PUNCH NEEDLE
EXTRAVAGANZA!

$49.99

This project book is less how-to and 
more "dive right in!" Here are 27 
inspired ways to add colorfully 
crafted inspiration to your decor, 
your wardrobe, everyday 
accessories, and your artistic 
gift-giving needs. For those who are 
newcomers to the punch needle 
world, and for all who have learned 
the skills and are ready for new, 
one-of-a-kind projects. 

WHAT ALEXANDER MCQUEEN
CAN TEACH YOU ABOUT
FASHION

$27.99

If Alexander McQueen were to give 
a masterclass on design, creativity 
and attitude, what wisdom would he 
impart? Discover McQueen's life, 
work and legacy in this sharply 
curated biography focusing on 
artistic spirit.

FASHION: THE WHOLE 
STORY 

$55.00

This ambitious and fascinating book 
traces the history of fashion in 
every part of the world, from 
Greco-Roman woven-cloth clothing 
and the silk court dress of the 
Chinese Tang dynasty to 
contemporary sportswear designers 
and Japanese street culture. 
Organized chronologically, the book 
traces the evolution of fashion 
period by period and trend by trend. 

FASHION: THE ULTIMATE
HISTORY OF COSTUME

$89.99

Fashion is one of the defining 
features of human evolution and 
culture. Spanning from the first 
civilizations to today's most recent 
trends, this enlarged and updated 
edition of our bestseller analyses 
the importance and meaning of 
fashion via an in-depth approach 
and a rich selection of illustrations 
and photographs.

THE DENIM MANUAL

$65.00

The Denim Manual is one of the 
world’s most comprehensive denim 
books covering every aspect of 
denim, including history, fabrics, 
designs, washing and care.
The book also introduces technical 
processes and terminology unique 
to the denim industry with insider 
tips. It is accompanied by over 700 
illustrations and photos, presenting 
information in an easy-to-read 
visual format. 

MODERN FABRICS

$89.99

Step inside the studios of today's 
modern fabric design stars from 
around the world. From the bold 
florals of Kaffe Fassett to the subtle 
patterning of Naomi Ito to the retro 
style of design collective Ruby Star 
Society, Modern Fabric features a 
sophisticated, eclectic group of 
designers working in an exciting 
variety of techniques.

WHAT COCO CHANEL CAN
TEACH YOU ABOUT FASHION

$27.99

If Coco Chanel were to give a 
masterclass on design, creativity 
and attitude, what wisdom would 
she impart? Discover the life, work 
and legacy of Chanel in this sharply 
curated biography focusing on 
artistic spirit. Chanel's ethos 
captured the imagination of 
post-war women, releasing them 
from the corseted silhouette and 
changing what we wore forever. 

SWATCH THIS: 3000 
COLOUR PALETTES

$65.00

Expand your colour confidence with 
a comprehensive dictionary of 
colour combinations! Colour 
combinations are made simple with 
this helpful reference that includes 
endless amounts of colour palettes 
for artists to perfect their colour 
selection every time.
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NADINE IJEWERE

$120.00

Dazzling color, dreamlike 
backgrounds, and a fierce gaze are 
the hallmarks of Ijewere's work. But 
most important to the London 
photographer is subversion of 
traditional concepts of beauty. In 
fashion work, editorials, 
advertisements, and film stills, 
Ijewere draws not only on her roots 
in Nigeria and Jamaica, but also on 
her own experiences as a young 
Black woman.

MARIO TESTINO

$58.00

"The way men are seen in 
photography, in fashion, and the way 
that men look at pictures of 
themselves has changed in recent 
years. It is a subject that has come 
into focus: The masculine image, a 
man's personal style, changing 
attitudes to the male face and body." 
- Mario Testino. In SIR the influential 
photographer presents over 300 
photographs in his search to define 
the allure of men.

$34.99

VISUAL MERCHANDISING
AND DISPLAY

$89.99

This comprehensive textbook 
constitutes an essential tool for 
students and professionals who 
want to work in the field of visual 
merchandising in retail, a discipline 
which combines the principles of 
marketing, creativity and design. 

CHRONICLE OF WESTERN 
COSTUME

$21.99

Here, in more than one thousand 
full-colour illustrations, is the history 
of Western costume, from ancient 
Egypt to Paris fashion. There 
meticulous drawings are organized 
in chronological sections and 
accompanied by detailed 
descriptions of each figure, 
including the items of costume 
shown and the types of fabric, cut, 
pattern and colour that have been 
used over the centuries.

WILD TEXTILES: FORAGED
AND FOUND (Due September)

$45.00

A guide to harnessing the world of 
nature to create sustainable textile 
art. Textile artist Alice Fox shows 
how to work with found, foraged, 
gathered and grown materials to 
create fabulous textile pieces that 
are inspired by, and made from, 
nature. She encourages crafters to 
be open minded and experimental, 
using local (and sometimes) 
unconventional materials.

RECORD, MAP & CAPTURE
IN TEXTILE ART 
(Due September)

$49.99

A guide to the increasingly popular 
trend of transforming data into 
beautiful textile art. This stylish and 
fascinating book from 
up-and-coming textile art star 
Jordan Cunliffe shows how raw 
data, maps and personal experience 
can be distilled into textile art, 
producing mesmerising works with 
deep meaning, whether obvious or 
hidden.

VISUAL MERCHANDISING

$70.00

The practice of creative writing - 
being expressive, exploring ideas, 
crafting words, shaping stories - can 
deepen your appreciation of life and 
enhance your wellbeing. With 100 
inspiring prompts, insights and 
exercises specially devised by an 
award-winning author and creative 
writing teacher, discover how to write 
well - and thrive.

MIXED MEDIA TEXILE ART IN
3 DIMENSIONS 
(Due September)

$49.99

Fresh ideas and techniques for the 
rapidly evolving area of 
three-dimensional textiles.
Leading textile artist Ann Goddard 
takes three-dimensional textiles to 
a new level in this practical book. 
Drawing inspiration from natural 
landscapes, organic material and a 
concern for the environment.

GLIMPSE OF EMOTION

$120.00

A collection of Damien Dufresne’s 
work capturing the relationship 
between the art of makeup and the 
art of photography. When the art of 
photography and the art of makeup 
come together, the resulting work 
is deeply original. World-renowned 
photographer Damien Dufresne 
has been living in China for several 
years. There, he’s developed a 
passion for Chinese symbolism in 
colors and makeup.

CREATING PHOTOGRAPHS:
ALBERT WATSON
Let legendary fashion and portrait 
photographer Albert Watson guide 
you through how he captures his 
amazing images. In a series of 
bite-sized lessons Watson unveils 
the stories behind his most-famous 
shots and gives you the inspiration, 
tips and ideas to take into your own 
photography.
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SNEAKERS UNBOXED:
STUDIO TO STREET

$35.00

This is the first book to gather leading 
designers, creators and industry 
insiders to reflect on sneaker design 
and its ground-breaking impact on 
popular culture. Contributors provide 
insights into the evolution of sneakers 
from sport-wear to style icons, the 
processes and people involved in 
sneaker design and its global future.

THE ULTIMATE SNEAKER
BOOK

$115.00

Traversing 100 years of history, each 
chapter paints a rollicking picture of 
the sneaker industry's evolution. Air 
Max, Air Force, Adi Dassler, 
Converse, Kanye, Dapper Dan, Dee 
Brown, Michael Jordan, and 
Yeezy-along with obscure treasures 
like Troop, Airwalk, and Vision Street 
Wear-are all exhaustively 
documented.

POSES FOR FASHION 
ILLUSTRATION: MEN 

$39.99

An Encyclopedia of Men's Poses 
Poses for fashion illustration is a 
set of professional template cards 
tailor-made for developing fashion 
illustrations and sketches. It is 
packed with a wide range of 
occasions, dimensions, and body 
shapes - to provide all the practical 
poses you'll ever need in your 
career. 

FIGURE DRAWING FOR
FASHION DESIGN VOL.1

$89.99

Fashion drawing is the most 
important way to visualize ideas 
and concepts in costume and 
fashion design. This new and 
expanded two-volume edition of the 
already classic title Figure Drawing 
for Fashion Design—revised, 
updated and expanded—is a 
precise, topic-by-topic manual that 
will help readers acquire and 
perfect their skills drawing fashion 
designs on the female form. 

100 FACES AND FIGURES 
REALISTIC LINE DRAWING

$29.99

Featuring 600+ sketches depicting 
a vast array of human expressions, 
movements, and more, Draw Like 
an Artist: 100 Faces and Figures is 
a must-have visual reference book 
for student artists, illustrators, 
cartoonists, urban sketchers, and 
anyone seeking to improve their 
realistic drawing skills.

All Secondary Schools are regularly 
sent a flyer detailing new books. 

ORDERING

New titles 

Please treat it as your “go-to” place for 
inspiring, fascinating, engrossing and 
beautiful Art and Design books.

FREE

10%
OFF

NEW

TEXTILEPEDIA

$70.00

Textilepedia is an extensive textile 
dictionary that covers all essential 
fabric knowledge - from deciphering 
different types of materials to 
understanding your finishing 
options. A balance between text 
and imagery; it acts as a quick 
easy-to-navigate guide - simplifying 
complicated fabric and fibre 
information using comparisons and 
relatable stories. 

The easiest and best way to manage your selection and order 
your books is via our easy-to-use online webstore.

If you would prefer, you can email glenn@gordonharris.co.nz

If you are having trouble 
sourcing a particular title or 
have any other queries, please 
feel free to email me 
glenn@gordonharris.co.nz

I’d love to hear from you! 
The team and I thank you 
for your on-going support.

New titles 
added 
every week!

FREE

10%
OFF

FREIGHT
ON ORDERS

OVER $75

and

NEW

We are currently experiencing delays with overseas suppliers.
We will keep you informed of any potential issues. Virtually every facet of the rich and 

diverse world of human creativity is
represented on our online store.

Please treat it as your “go-to” place for
inspiring, fascinating, engrossing and 
beautiful Art and Design books.



ORDER FORM AUGUST 2022

SCHOOL                                                                               DATE
CONTACT NAME                                                     PHONE 
EMAIL
STREET ADDRESS                                                                TOWN/CITY

FREE 10%
SCHOOL DISCOUNT

ORDER 
NUMBER

off retail prices as 
listed. All prices 

include GST  

TITLE ISBN QTY TOTALPRICE

FREIGHT Stock and prices are 
subject to availability

ON ORDERS
OVER $75

VITAMIN T: THREADS & TEXTILES IN CONTEMPORARY ART 9781838663575 $70.00
FABRIC FOR FASHION :THE COMPLETE GUIDE 2ND EDITION 9781913947934 $65.00
FASHION DESIGN RESEARCH SECOND EDITION 9781913947668 $49.99
CIRCULAR FASHION SUSTAINABLE FASHION 9781786278876 $55.00
THE MEN'S FASHION BOOK 9781838662479 $150.00
JOURNEYS IN NATURAL DYEING 9781419747076 $49.99
FASHION DESIGNERS A-Z 9783836587563 $58.00
OUTSTANDING HIGH SCHOOL SKETCHBOOKS 9780473575816 $59.99
VIVIENNE WESTWOOD CATWALK 9780500023792 $120.00
CHANEL CATWALK 9780500023440 $110.00
PRADA CATWALK 9780500022047 $110.00
YSL CATWALK 9780500022399 $110.00
DIOR CATWALK 9780500519349 $110.00
LOUIS VUITTON CATWALK 9780500519943 $110.00
VERSACE CATWALK 9780500023808 $120.00
PAUL SMITH 9781838661274 $120.00
MARIMEKKO: THE ART OF PRINTMAKING 9780500023983 $110.00
VOGUE FANTASY & ART 9781419733321 $155.00
FASHION DRAPING TECHNIQUES VOL 1 9788417656324 $69.99
FASHION DRAPING TECHNIQUES VOL 2 9788417656454 $69.99
ADVANCED CREATIVE DRAPING 9781913947729 $90.00
PATTERN CUTTING FOR MENSWEAR 9781786276759 $100.00
SEWING MANUAL SKIRTS AND TROUSERS 9788417412814 $89.99
PATTERN CUTTING FOR WOMANSWEAR VOL 1 9788417656751 $89.99
GEOMETRY OF HAND SEWING 9781419726637 $54.99
ROTARY CUTTING BASICS 9781644031162 $29.99
BASIC BLACK 26 EDGY ESSENTIALS 9784805313084 $29.99
EMPOWERED EMBROIDERY 9781633228849 $32.99
TEXTURES FROM NATURE IN TEXTILE ART 9781849946704 $45.00
RESILIENT STITCH 9781849946070 $45.00
STITCH IN BLOOM 9781784883966 $32.99
ENCHANTING EMBROIDERY DESIGN 9784805316184 $24.99
EMBROIDERY FOR EVERYONE 9781849947114 $49.99
COMPLETE BAG MAKING MASTERCLASS 9781446308110 $45.00
PUNCH NEEDLE EXTRAVAGANNZA 9780764362583 $49.99
BAGS FOR LIFE 21 PROJECTS TO MAKE 9781911663409 $39.99
SUPERCUTE SEWING 9781446308400 $49.99
100 MICRO CROCHET MOTIFS 9781446308394 $49.99



availability

TITLE ISBN QTY TOTALPRICE

$
$
$

SUBTOTAL

TOTAL (INCL GST)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT

ORDER FORM AUGUST 2022

SUSTAINABLE FASHION 9788417412791 $75.00
MENDING DIRECTORY 9781800920361 $39.99
CIRCULAR DESIGN FOR FASHION 9781912737086 $80.00
MODERN MENDING 9781782219606 $54.99
NATURAL DYEING WORK WITH PLANT DYES 9781784884949 $39.99
ZERO WASTE GIFT WRAP FUROSHIKI 9781446308431 $29.99
FASHION DESIGN COURSE 3RD ED REVISED UPDATED 9780500296882 $39.99
THE ART OF REPAIR 9781780724423 $49.99
SASHIKO FOR MAKING AND MENDING 9780804853859 $29.99
CREATIVE MENDING 9780804854740 $45.00
WATERCOLOUR FASHION ILLUSTRATION 9781446308738 $49.99
PAINT WITH THREAD 9781446308486 $69.99
PUNCH NEEDLE EXTRAVAGANZA 9780764362583 $49.99
WHAT ALEXANDER MCQUEEN CAN TEACH YOU ABOUT FASHION 9780711259065 $27.99
WHAT COCO CHANEL CAN TEACH YOU ABOUT FASHION 9780711259096 $27.99
FASHION THE WHOLE STORY 9780500296011 $55.00
FASHION: THE ULTIMATE HISTORY OF COSTUME 9788417412678 $89.99
THE DENIM MANUAL 9789887711131 $65.00
MODERN FABRICS 9781616898373 $89.99
SWATCH THIS 3000 COLOUR PALETTES 9781644032275 $65.00
GLIMPSE OF EMOTION 9781419761096 $120.00
NADINE IJEWERE 9783791387765 $120.00
MARIO TESTINO 9783836588140 $58.00
ALBERT WATSON 9781786278838 $34.99
VISUAL MERCHANDISING 9781913947323 $70.00
VISUAL MERCHANDISING AND DISPLAY 9788417656065 $89.99
CHRONICLE OF WESTERN COSTUME 9780500284476 $21.99 
WILD TEXTILES: FORAGED AND FOUND 9781849947879 $45.00
RECORD, MAP & CAPTURE IN TEXTILE ART 9781849947190 $49.99
MIXED MEDIA TEXTILE ART IN 3 DIMENSIONS 9781849946926 $49.99
SNEAKER UNBOXED: STUDIO TO STREET 9781875005539 $35.00
ULTIMATE SNEAKER BOOK 9783836572231 $115.00
POSES FOR FASHION ILLUSTRATION: MEN 9789887711124 $39.99
TEXTILEPEDIA 9789887711094 $70.00
FIGURE DRAWING FOR FASHION DESIGN VOL.1 9788417656553 $89.99
100 FACES AND FIGURES REALISTIC LINE DRAWING 9781631597107 $29.99


